
SALES RESULTS FROM PUBLIC AUCTION NOVEMBER 5TH THRU 8TH, 2011 

    Asmt Sales Price ExcessProceeds   

        

008-003-005-000 $5,300.00 $3,633.71   

008-025-059-000 NO BID     

016-026-023-000 $6,200.00 $3,843.95   

016-032-008-000 NO BID     

016-032-011-000 NO BID     

020-010-003-000 NO BID     

021-004-040-000 NO BID     

026-026-049-000 REDEEMED NO BID   

026-701-044-000 NO BID     

026-703-014-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-703-018-000 $300.00 NONE   

026-704-017-000 NO BID     

026-704-049-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-705-011-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-705-045-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-706-032-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-707-013-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-707-014-000 REDEEMED     

026-707-015-000 REDEEMED     

026-707-023-000 NO BID     

026-707-043-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-709-018-000 NO BID     

026-709-036-000 NO BID     

026-711-020-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-712-009-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-713-003-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-713-033-000 NO BID     

026-713-041-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-714-012-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-714-037-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-714-044-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-715-028-000 NO BID     

026-715-029-000 NO BID     

026-716-011-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-716-022-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-717-050-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-718-023-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-718-024-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-718-046-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-719-011-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-719-014-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-719-033-000 NO BID     

026-719-047-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-722-006-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-722-039-000 NO BID     

026-723-012-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-724-016-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-724-017-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-724-037-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-725-002-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-725-003-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-725-005-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-725-021-000 NO BID     



026-725-022-000 NO BID     

026-725-031-000 NO BID     

026-726-002-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-726-034-000 $200.00 NONE   

026-727-002-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-727-008-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-727-009-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-728-009-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-729-044-000 NO BID     

026-731-002-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-731-004-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-731-007-000 $100.00 NONE   

026-731-018-000 $200.00 NONE   

040-003-006-000 NO BID     

055-059-002-000 NO BID     

058-077-007-000 NO BID     

064-015-010-000 $7,035.00 $6,095.27   

065-024-010-000 $10,700.00 $5,958.60   

070-029-003-000 $7,600.00 $6,060.65   

070-036-025-000 REDEEMED     

        

 


